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Anoka County Board action

RECORD CHOSEN
AS LEGAL
NEWSPAPER FOR
ANOKA COUNTY
A contract to take effect February 6 between
Anoka County and the Anoka County Record for
legal notice publishing services was approved at
the Anoka County Board meeting of Jan. 6.
County commissioners voted 6-1 to award the
county’s legal notice business for 2015 to the
Record. The newspaper offered the lowest bid to
publish all legal notices of the county at $2.90
per column inch.
Treated separately were the printing and
distribution of the county’s financial statement,
for which the Quad Press was the low bidder
of 4.8 cents per printed piece. The financial
statement is required to be inserted into two
newspapers. The low bids for the two insertions
came from the Anoka Union-Herald and the
Blaine-Spring Lake Park Life of 5.5 cents and
4.9 cents, per piece, respectively.
The Anoka County Record will be publishing
the summaries of the County Board meeting
minutes, the delinquent real estate taxes listings,
Board of Appeal meeting minutes summaries,
and all other legal advertisements of the county.
The contract runs for one year. The bidding
process for the county’s legal notice business
typically begins in November of each year, and
is awarded by a vote of the County Board in
early January.
During the Jan. 6 County Board meeting,
Commissioner Jim Kordiak, whose district
includes Columbia Heights and Fridley, said
“I’m unable to support this” but acknowledged
while the Record meets the legal test for a legal
newspaper, “it is not a widely-read or circulated
news piece.” Commissioner Matt Look, whose
district includes the western portion of the
county, including Ramsey, said he would
like to see legislative action that would
allow the publishing of legal notices
online rather than the required print-only.

NOWTHEN RESIDENTS FIND
NEW USE FOR PITCHFORKS

About 65 grim-faced, agitated folk rounded themselves up to go to a Special meeting of the Nowthen City
Council, Monday night Dec. 29. The building would have had a hard time accepting a larger crowd because it
was on the brink of standing-room-only.
On the table near the entrance was a sign-up sheet. It was not clear what its purpose was. There were some
comment cards that people could fill out. There was no agenda to be found, required by state law. At least half
of the attendees signed their names to the sheet.
The first question a stranger would ask is, why are all these people
here? After speaking with a few of them, the explanations were
a vague pastiche of gossip, sent by anonymous flyers, e-mails or
telephone calls. How did all these people know there was a meeting
tonight? Apparently an underground network is in place in Nowthen, the former Burns Township.
No agenda was posted on the city web site, nor was an agenda seen at the city hall. But they all knew something was cookin’. It conjures up the sight of Lum and Abner waiting for “their ring” at the Jot ‘Em Down
Store. Ten long rings means “everyone get on the line” for an emergency message: “thar’s a meetin’ Monday
night at th’ town hall . . .”
Even the television news had been summoned by someone involved with “the party line.” A photographer from

Observations from the Field: Nowthen continued on page 4

ANOKA COUNTY QUOTE/BID TABULATION Date: 12/2/2014
Section I

Section II

Section III

Section IV

County

Printing
of Tabloid
(Financial
Statement)

Section V

Section VI

Section VII

2nd

Board of

Board
1st
publication Appeals
The question has been brought up many
Delinquent Summary printing of the publication of Tabloid Summary
Ads
times in the legislature but has never
Minutes
Minutes
of Tabloid
Taxes
(per
tabloid for 1st
(second
gained traction due to protests of the
column
(per column (per column and 2nd inser- (first insertion/
publication/
(per column
Vendor
inch)
inch)
inch)
tion/per piece
per piece)
per piece)
inch)
Minnesota Newspaper Association and
Blaine Spring Lake Park Life (ECM) No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$0.049
No Bid
the rural newspapers that depend on
this revenue from local governments.
Anoka County Record
$2.90
$2.90
$2.90
No Bid
$0.060
$0.060
$2.90
The rural papers also argue that the
Anoka Union-Herald (ECM)
$5.90
$4.90
$3.00
$0.0575
$0.055
No Bid
$5.90
penetration of the internet into every
Quad Community Press
$7.25
$5.99
$7.25
$0.0480
$0.0580
$0.0550
$7.25
home in their areas is very low and
most people remain print readers. A bill
qualified to publish government legal notices, is the
Minneapolis and Saint Paul, for example, publish
that would have allowed local governments to
newspaper has to publish minimally twice per month
their legal notices in newspapers that are wholly in
choose between print or website publication
and distribute 400 printed copies in the newspaper’s
that business. Any news articles in those papers are
was killed in committee a few years ago.
service area. State law defines service areas by
about politics and government. The papers are also not
Proponents of the bill expected that most rurally- government jurisdiction: cities, counties, school
available on the street, but by paid mail subscription
located governments would still choose to use
districts, etc. Most newspapers define their service
only. One of them has about 800 subscribers, not
newspapers to print their legal notices anyway,
areas by county.
much above the state law requirement of 400 copies
and that the website option would be mainly
to qualify as a legal newspaper. Both papers require
used by metro-area governments where internet State law does not dictate the content of a legal
a paid subscription to its website content as well, with
newspaper, except for a ratio of advertising to news
availability is nearly 100%.
the exception of the legal notices.
content. There are no requirements that the government
Commissioner Kordiak’s comments about
choose a legal newspaper that is also a generalThe Anoka County Record’s complete content in
circulation and readership expressed a
audience newspaper, one that may have high school
print and online is available free of charge. Paid
want, rather than a requirement. Among the
sports coverage, recipes or articles about quilt making. subscriptions are available via first-class U.S. Mail. —
requirements of state law for a newspaper to be
ACR staff
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Rep. Scott serving Rep. Uglem
on five committees working on new
On Thursday, we introduced bills

our first five bills in the House,
which represent our five major
priorities this legislative session:
growing jobs, providing our
children with the best education
possible, ensuring that our
seniors receive top-notch longterm care, investing in our
roads and bridges, and securing
access and affordability in
health care. These five priorities will help us to ensure
that Minnesota continues to move forward and provide
more opportunity for our children and grandchildren.
This session, I am very honored to be serving as the
Chair of the Civil Law and Data Practices committee,
where I can work to see that your private information
is protected. In addition to my role on the Civil Law
and Data Practices committee, I will be serving as a
member of the Commerce and Regulatory Reform,
Government Operations and Elections Policy,
Job Growth and Energy Affordability Policy and
Finance, and Rules and Legislative Administration
committees. I look forward to hearing many bills that
will help Minnesota families and businesses.

If you plan on visiting the Capitol, please be sure to
call my Legislative Assistant at (651) 296-5813 to
schedule a time to sit down with me in my office to
discuss the issues that are most important to you! I
look forward to seeing many new and familiar faces
throughout the legislative session, and always treasure
the time I spend meeting with community members.

The 2015 session marks the
beginning of my second term
serving the communities of
Champlin and Coon Rapids.
I'm excited for the next two
years, and to be a part of the
House Majority where I can
continue working on legislation to help our community
and improve the lives of Minnesotans across the state.
I'm currently working on legislation to add a lane to
Highway 10 between Hanson and Round Lake Blvd.
I plan to introduce that bill in the coming weeks.
I also am a co-author on House File 1, which aims to
grow better-paying jobs in all parts of the state, and
House File 10, which would provide a tax credit to
businesses who hire veterans.
Veteran unemployment is higher than that of the
civilian population, and with thousands of veterans
now returning home from overseas, it's important we
help our servicemen and women who fought for our
freedoms, and make their transition back to civilian
life a bit easier.
As always, my door is open and I hope you'll stay in
touch as session continues. If you want to schedule a
meeting, have a question, or would like to share your
comments, please email me at rep.mark.uglem@
house.mn or call 651-296-5513.

Sen. Hoffman introduces new bills

We had a very productive first week of the 2015 session. I was very pleased to be a part
of Senate leadership’s presentation of the first six bill introductions.
I introduced Senate File 6, ‘4K for Kids’. Passage of this legislation would give every
family a choice to enroll their 4 year old in a pre-kindergarten program if they wish.
Studies show that high quality preschool programs benefit ALL children. In the last
biennium we passed and funded voluntary all-day kindergarten. We are proposing this
next step to continue to create long-term plans to help Minnesotans continue to make
progress in closing the achievement gap and to promote economic and educational
advancement to every region of the state.
I also had the opportunity to co-author Senate File 4 with chief author Sen. Kathy
Sheran. This child protection bill will immediately pursue three recommendations from
the Governor’s Task Force on the Protection of Children this session. The bill repeals the
statutory provision barring a county worker’s consideration of screened-out reports of child maltreatment when
making screening decisions. It also amends the mandated reporter statute and screening guidelines to allow
screeners to seek collateral information when making a screening decision. The third recommendation requires
county agencies to use screening guidelines, at least as a floor for decision-making, and have increased reviews
and quality assurances to provide oversight. There may be additional recommendations from the Governor’s
Task Force on the Protection of Children as the bill travels through committee hearings. These changes will
give people who have the responsibility of determining the welfare of our children the information, resources
and tools necessary to make the right decision for every child. The children must come first.
Please contact me with any questions or recommendations. It is a privilege to represent you in the Minnesota
Senate and your perspectives are important. Stay warm out there!
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Sen. Benson
ready for the new
session

The 2015 legislative session
is underway! I am excited to
get started; here in the Senate,
I want to focus on education
reform so that all Minnesota
students have equal access
to an outstanding education.
You deserve hardworking,
transparent government that
serves the citizens and respects
the taxpayers of District 31. I want to help make
Minnesota an easier place for entrepreneurs and
small business owners. I want to improve our roads
and bridges to make your commutes easier.
Above all, I want to be your voice in St. Paul. District
31 is a great place to live and I am so proud to be
your Senator.
What happens at the Capitol has a direct impact
on your life and the lives of your family, so please
contact me with your comments, questions, and
concerns. Citizens run the legislature in Minnesota
and representation should reflect that.
Tax Conformity
The federal government has made changes to its tax
code that Minnesota state law does not allow. If the
legislature does nothing, it will result in you paying
more than you need to. It would also result in even
more paperwork and valuable time. I hope we can
pass a simple bill that puts Minnesota’s tax code back
in step with federal law. Similar bills have easily
garnered bipartisan support, and I hope the same can
happen in the Senate this year.
In this bill, educators may deduct up to $250 in
expenses for classroom supplies, homeowners may
deduct mortgage insurance premiums, and students
and parents may deduct up to $4,000 in tuition and
related higher education expenses, among other
helpful provisions.
Every-other-year session?
We know it won’t be business as usual in 2016. The
reality of Capitol construction may push us “back
to the future.” The Senate chamber will be under
construction during the 2016 legislative session, so
different meeting plans will need to be made. We are
a part-time legislature and it’s time to think about
returning to our roots.
Previously, the legislature met every other year and
it took fewer than four months to get the job done
— letting us return home to serve our communities
that we represent. The government was smaller, it
cost less, and it allowed us to better connect with the
people we serve.

‘4K for Kids’ bill (DFL Caucus press release)
Research show that up to 90 percent of brain development occurs before the age of five. In Minnesota,
nearly half of children entering kindergarten are not
fully prepared to succeed – this session Sen. John
Hoffman (DFL-Champlin, Brooklyn Park and Coon
Rapids) has introduced a bill that will help address
these challenges. The ‘4K for Kids’ bill proposes to
offer pre-kindergarten programming free of charge
for any 4-year-old in Minnesota, if their parents
choose. Studies prove that high quality preschool
programs benefit ALL children.
“Minnesota is already a leader in education and
we’ve made huge strides in the past two years with
our commitment to voluntary all-day kindergarten.
The ‘4K for Kids’ bill builds on those successes to
ensure all Minnesota school children are prepared
for kindergarten,” said Sen. Hoffman. “Our youngest
Minnesotans deserve the best. This program will help
close the achievement gap by lining up with school
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benchmarks and creating a continuum to ensure more community or technical college.
students have a successful educational career.”
Rural Health Professional Loan Forgiveness
With passage, the legislation would go into effect in Initiative. This bill would forgive about 60 percent
the fall of 2016, and all children who have turned four of a health care professional’s college debt if they
agree to serve up to four years in rural or other high
by Sept. 1 of 2016 can attend the program.
need areas across the state.
Hoffman’s legislation was one of six bills introduced
Child Protection Legislation: This legislaat a press conference at the Capitol on Jan. 8. The
tion
puts
in place stronger protections for children
other bills were:
facing possible maltreatment. The three components
Flood Relief Bill. This bill appropriates
of this bill will give professionals in the process of
$6.85 million to secure disaster relief funding for
determining the welfare of a child all the informadozens of hard-hit counties across the state. It also
tion they need to make the best decisions possible.
calls for an additional $3 million to receive matching
PIPELINE Bill: The MN PIPELINE legislafunds for local roads and more than $2.4 million for
tion connects students with companies and provides
erosion, sediment, and water quality control.
on-the-job training. Money for this program will alWorkMN. This higher education tuition relow businesses to train workers to fit industry needs
lief bill proposes to offer two years of free tuition to through a new model where the costs are shared
Minnesota high school graduates at any Minnesota
between the state, businesses and students.
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Always on the lookout for governmental waste, fraud, and abuse in Anoka County
The DFL Senate killed a bonding bill and blamed the
GOP for not “doing their work.”
The Senate wasn’t on the ballot that year and the
House was, as they are every two years.

command a sense of entitlement and regularly raid
the public fisc to support that view, the events of
recent weeks have once again confirmed this sad
state of affairs beyond a shadow of a doubt.
First, we had Community Action of Minneapolis, a
non-profit run by Dayton’s DFL cronies.

THOSE CYNICAL DEMOCRATS

The public bought the narrative and it cost the GOP
13 seats and nearly the majority, as they hung on
with a narrow 68-66 majority.

Yes, those tricky, tricky Democrats are always
cynical, but the change in leadership in the Minnesota
House has put their cynicism into hyper-drive.

Look for the gas tax and other issues that the DFL
did nothing to address to suddenly become “crisis”
issues that just have to pass this session.

It appears that the Democrats in the legislature and
their co-conspirator Mark Dayton are resorting to
the old playbook to play politics with this legislative
session instead of working to find bi-partisan
solutions to problems.

POLITICAL ARSON
This item could have fit in the column above but
just as easily fits under our occasional series on DFL
political arson.

Even more galling, we learned that the Commissioner
of the Department of Commerce, a Dayton
appointee, shirked his duty to investigate the matter
and admitted that political considerations played a
role.

In short, that playbook consists of supporting all
sorts of bad ideas and then slamming Republicans
for “obstructing” the process, thereby feeding their
political narrative that Republicans can’t govern.

For the uninitiated, “political arson” is the art of a
politician or his party causing a problem and then
proposing some Big Government solution to “fix”
the very problem they created.

And there’s the Minneapolis Public Schools, a failed
public institution. The worst performer in a universe
of bad performers. The shortest midget in the tallest
midget contest, so to speak.

A classic example of this cynicism is the gas tax.

In other words, this is pretty much the way the DFL
governs Minnesota and America.

We have recently learned, to no one’s surprise, that
high-level employees have been abusing district
credit cards, with scant or no documentation to
demonstrate the legitimacy of many purchases.

Governor Dayton supports a gas tax increase. So do
Senate Democrats and so do House Democrats.
That’s funny. Dayton didn’t support a gas tax
increase when he ran in 2010 and didn’t support one
until very recently.
Same with DFLers in the legislature.
The DFL controlled both houses of the legislature
and the governor’s office for the past two years yet
the gas tax wasn’t talked about in great detail and
certainly didn’t become law.
Huh.
If a gas tax increase is such a good idea in 2015, why
wasn’t it a good idea in 2014? Or 2013?
After all, our roads and bridges have been crumbling
for many years and it’s not as if suddenly there is a
need for some serious repair and replacement work.
So, again, why wasn’t this a good idea when they
controlled the whole show?
Why is it so imperative now?
The DFL knows that the gas tax isn’t popular but
they also know fixing roads and bridges is popular.
So how to thread the needle to make Republicans
look bad?
That requires setting up a gas tax increase as one
half of an equation that establishes a false choice.
The DFL would have you believe that in order to fix
our transportation infrastructure, there must be new
funding.
Never mind that growing budget surplus.
Never mind reprioritizing monies away from
wasteful projects like light rail and commuter rail.
And never mind stripping out the waste throughout
state government, such as MnDOT. Maybe we
could cut back on those state grants to Minneapolis
Community Action.
But finding solutions isn’t and never was the name
of the game.
The name of the game is to make Republicans an
offer they can’t accept and then use the mainstream
media to blame Republicans for not doing something
on this issue.
Hey, it’s a formula that has worked time and again
for the DFL.
Recall 2004, when the GOP controlled that House
and the DFL controlled the Senate.
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This week, state Rep. Ryan Winkler (DFL - Golden
Valley), took to the floor of the Minnesota House to
push his campaign finance bill to ostensibly shine
greater transparency on PAC and Super PAC funding
in Minnesota.
Of course, Democrats have for years benefitted from
this type of political spending, certainly more so
than Republicans.
Rep. Winkler and his DFL friends don’t have
to wonder where the PAC funding originates.
They know full well it’s coming from the likes of
billionaire hedge fund managers like George Soros
and Tom Steyer. And right here in Minnesota,
Winkler knows full well that Alida Messinger, a
member of the Idle Rich class and a beneficiary of
Rockefeller oil money (and Mark Dayton’s former
Old Lady) has been pumping millions in cash she
never earned into DFL front groups like Alliance for
a Better (more liberal) Minnesota.
That’s not a secret.
In fact, this model of buying elections was perfected
by liberals out in Colorado, who managed to buy the
whole damn political establishment until citizens
came to their senses and started cleaning house,
starting with the recall of two gun-hating state
senators and then electing a Republican to the U.S.
Senate this past fall.
The DFL set this fire and now want to pretend
to they’re right there with the bucket brigade to
extinguish the flames.
Moreover, this is a “twofer” in that it dove tails well
with the item above.
If this campaign finance “reform” bill was such a
great idea, why wasn’t it passed last year or the year
before?
Was it because the DFL was enjoying the heck out of
that Rockefeller money?
Of course, now that Republicans have restored some
balance to state government, this is one of many
issues that has suddenly hit the DFL like a bolt of
lightning, demanding quick action.
For every one of these kinds of bills, the Republicans
ought to ask the DFL author why their legislation
wasn’t passed last year by their own DFL colleagues,
who had all the power to pass it.
ARROGANT AND ENTITLED
While any right thinking American understands
that Democrats are by nature political elitists who
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These cronies, as we all know from news reports,
used taxpayer funds to pay for personal luxuries,
trips, concerts, and other illegal and unethical
expenditures.

But we do know the district spent $2,000 to frame
school jerseys to “show pride.”
Of course, they could show off test scores and
graduation rates to show pride. Never mind.
Finally, the arrogance and entitlement hat trick
was completed by state Senator David Tomassoni,
a former hockey player, entrenched politician, and
Iron Ranger.
Senator Tomassoni this week dispensed with any
illusions of a bright line between politicians and
lobbyists by taking a job with an organization that
exists to lobby government for money and regularly
has business before the very legislature in which
Tomassoni serves as a senator.
A group called the Range Association of
Municipalities and Schools (RAMS) has hired
Tomassoni to lead the association.
We’re told by Tomassoni that this is all cool because
he will take a leave of absence from the group every
legislative session.
How that eliminates the concern that he’s blurring
the distinction between legislator and lobbyist
escapes this publication.
It’s a clear conflict of interest and the fact that he
would take the job in the first place bespeaks the
arrogance of a DFL politician who has served
forever in a safe seat he will never lose.
That he has continued to defend this situation
with no regard to the appearance of things shows
that the arrogance and out of touch behavior that
got Democrats booted from office across the land
this past November is still alive and well here in
Minnesota.
You get the government you deserve, folks.
The Anoka County Watchdog is a place where concerned
taxpayers can find fact-supported information and
other resources about governmental waste and abuse
in Anoka County. My intent is to provide you, the
taxpayer, with the information you need to hold your
local politicians accountable.
Visit my website and sign up for free weekly e-mail
updates at www.AnokaCountyWatchdog.com or contact
me personally at harold@anokacountywatchdog.com.
Sincerely,
Harold E. Hamilton, owner.
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Observations from the field: Nowthen
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continued from page 1

Channel 9 Fox News showed up a little bewildered, trying to figure why he was there. There was no reporter with him; he was
there to shoot footage.
The phone call the media received promised either a lynching, a firing, a hiring, an appointment, or a fight.
None of those things happened, in a meeting that lasted just under an hour. Some disgruntled people left during the meeting,
hollering “bullshit!” as they left in a huff. A few others were gently escorted out of the room by a sheriff’s deputy after they had
made boisterous, disruptive comments.
The heart of the matter is not as complex as it seems and nothing was accomplished by holding this meeting. It was just another
in a series of city council meetings that have taken place since the election discussing city policies that could be put in place to
ensure a more professional and efficient way to run city hall and conduct the peoples’ business.
The people however have not been appreciative of this idea and want things to remain as they were in the township days,
before Nowthen became a city.
They don’t want a city administrator.
They also didn’t seem to care much about incoming mayor Jeff Pilon’s list of areas for improvement.
He cited problems with a lack of communication between staff and the council, council directives that have not been
completed, staff had missed applying to the county for recycling funds, etc.
(Pilon has served a four-year term on the city council and won the mayor’s seat in the last general election.)
He also had words for the audience about meeting decorum and not researching their facts very well. He said dollar figures the
naysayer group cites as facts have been blown out of proportion.
Along with Pilon, three other members of the city council attended this meeting: Mayor Bill Schulz, Harlan Meyer, and Mary
Rainville. Schulz and Meyer would be leaving office the following week.
The two new city councilors who were soon to take their oaths, Randy
Bettinger and Paul Reighard were in the audience. After Pilon’s opening
remarks, both were invited to join the council at the table. Both refused.
Reighard said he didn’t want to speak on the issue before taking office,
and that the people in the audience should be allowed to speak too (public
comment was taken only in written form). Bettinger made the same remarks
but also vowed to undo any decision made before he takes his seat.

CITY OF
COLUMBIA HEIGHTS
EMPLOYMENT NOTICE
LIBRARY PAGE (Part time)
DUTIES:
Work includes shelving,
circulation duties, phones, and
meeting the public.
REQUIRED
QUALIFICATIONS:
One year experience and/
or training in the operation
of a computer. Ability to
work standing up at the
circulation desk. Public contact
experience.
DESIRED
QUALIFICATIONS:
Experience working in a
library setting.
HOURS:
Approximately 14 hours per
week average. Applicants must
be available to be scheduled
anytime on Mondays 4 – 8 PM,
Tuesdays 4 - 8 PM, Wednesdays 4 - 8 PM, Thursdays 3
- 6 PM, Fridays 3 - 5 PM, and
Saturdays 10 AM - 4 PM.
WAGE RANGE:

Bettinger said “I am opposed” however no concrete proposals have been
presented yet.
There is talk about having a city administrator, a professional who may have
more ability to accomplish the day to day tasks and long-range council plans
than the present staff.
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$9.99 to $11.75 per hour
A watchdog videotapes the action

The audience at the meeting seemed convinced the salary of a city administrator will be $110,000 or more, with benefits.
That is true for most cities, but there are many factors that play into what that salary pays. How much responsibility is there
in the city? Are there enterprise funds, utilities, a large fire department, joint powers agreements, economic and development
authorities, TIF districts, and many other things. The complexity of the city’s infrastructure plays a hand in the salary paid.
Pilon said he would be looking for a part-time city administrator, one who may be retired, or even an administrator who would
volunteer.
The real work ahead of the new Nowthen City Council under Pilon’s leadership will be educating the citizenry about the
protocol of governance.
They’ll have to learn not to shout catcalls from the peanut gallery as has been the norm here for many years.
They’ll have to brush up on the open meeting and related laws because we found that many in the audience didn’t seem to
know them very well and were making mountains out of mole hills. They have complained that only the city clerk can take
meeting minutes (no, anyone can. The clerk is required by state law to keep a book of meeting minutes, not write them.) They
also thought that a quorum of elected officials can’t attend the same social event. Yes they can, as long as they don’t talk about
city business and start having a meeting.
By the way, the Channel 9 news photographer interviewed a few angry people outside the meeting place. He didn’t take
interviews however with any of the Nowthen elected officials. The story, even though there wasn’t anything to tell, ran that
night on the Fox9 newscast after an extremely slow news day.
Nowthen is a Minnesota city, but the Jot ‘Em Down Store is still there. “By grannies, I believe that’s our ring . . .”

APPLICATION
PROCEDURE:
City applications are available
at the Columbia Heights Public
Library. City applications
can also be downloaded
from our web site at www@
ci.columbia-heights.mn.us.
A City application form
must be completely filled out
and returned to the Library
Director, 820 40th Avenue NE,
Columbia Heights, MN 55421
(763) 706-3616 TDD (763)
706-3692.
Applications will be accepted
until 4:45 P.M. Friday,
January 23, 2015. In addition,
applicants may submit any
other data they feel is pertinent
to their consideration. Resumes
will be accepted in addition
to, but not in lieu of, a city
application.

NOW IT’S MAYOR PILON
Jeff Pilon took his oath of office as mayor of Nowthen, January 5. His family, friends and supporters gathered at the Nowthen
Alliance Church for the event on a bitterly cold Monday night.
The oath was administered by Deb Korin, wife of Mark Korin, the mayor of neighboring Oak Grove.
The former and first mayor of Nowthen, Bill Schulz offered his congratulations to Pilon and along with a few others from the
audience, gave some reminiscences of past Nowthen political history.
After Mayor Pilon made his remarks, he explained to the crowd that if they hear murmuring in the community regarding the
validity of his oath, that the correct procedure had been thoroughly checked. There had been a question raised about whether
only a city clerk could administer an oath of office. Minnesota Statute 358.10 says, “All persons holding office under any law of
this state, or under the charter or ordinances of any municipal corporation thereof, including judges and clerks of election, and
all committee members, commissioners, trustees, referees, appraisers, assessors, and all others authorized or required by law to
Outgoing mayor Bill Schulz (left)
act or report upon any matter of fact, have the power to administer oaths they deem necessary to the proper discharge of their
greets Jeff Pilon shortly before he
respective duties.” The League of Minnesota Cities, a lobbying organization for city governments, specifically mentions city
takes the oath of office
clerks, notary publics, Register of Deeds, Justice of the Peace as qualified. Intepreting the language of the state statute, virtually
any elected official in the state, commission member, trustee, judges, can administer an oath.
Pilon explained that Mrs. Korin could administer the oath and sign his election certificate as she is a Notary Public. He also said he didn’t see the need for city
clerk Corrie LeDoucer to drive to his event to administer the oath as there were many other options provided by state law.
PAGE 4

ANOKA COUNTY RECORD

JANUARY 16, 2015

ANOKA COUNTY RECORD

PAGE 5

ANOKA COUNTY
SHERIFF
CRIME REPORT
ANDOVER

Thefts and Damage to Property
01.03 151xx Yellowpine St NW – attempted break in;
damage to windows and garage
01.03 10xx 152 Ln NW – vandalism to two vehicles;
keyed
01.03 153xx Xeon St NW – forced entry into a vehicle;
tools
01.05 154xx Wintergreen St NW – unsecure vehicle;
tabs, GPS
01.08 21xx 135 Ln NW – mail stolen from the mailbox

The Un-Expendables:

School District
Superintendents retire,
get rehired with
pension and pay
By Tom Steward | Watchdog Minnesota Bureau

EDINA, Minn.— They could be called “The Un-Expendables,” public school superintendents who retire
for a few days before they’re lured back for a sequel
at their former jobs — with full salary, benefits, incentives and pension.

JANUARY 16, 2015
“Minnesota law expressly allows eligible school administrators to retire, begin drawing their pension
benefits and then be re-hired by their former employer
or another school district,” said Kristi Mussman, communications director for Independent School District
719. “Dr. Gruver’s agreement was reviewed and approved by the school board’s legal counsel and TRA.”
Post-retirement benefits listed in Gruver’s current
contract include total coverage family health and dental insurance coverage, a $200,000 life insurance policy, $4,000 for a whole life insurance policy, $4,000
for a health-care savings plan, 25 paid vacation days,
12 paid holidays, incentive pay of up to 4 percent of
her $160,000 salary, $2,000 for a tax-sheltered annuity, disability and liability insurance, plus a $600
monthly car allowance.

Educators employed before July 1989 whose age and
years of work experience total 90 years or more qualify for a pension. By technically retiring for as little as School boards often cite unretired educators as vione day, they can have it both ways — working and sionaries uniquely qualified to follow through with
COLUMBUS
collecting both a paycheck and pension.
changes they initiated before retiring, such as Edina’s
Arrests/Incidents
Next Generation plan.
01.03 179xx Vassar St NE –Garage Fire; deputies Ric Dressen, Edina Public Schools superintendent,
retired
in
2013
—
for
a
week.
After
receiving
$96,000
responded to a detached garage fire at the location.
”Going out and bringing in a new leader who would
Forest Lake Fire Department Extinguished the fire. No in severance pay, Dressen was back in the office, have to get up to speed, when we’re talking about
one was injured in the fire.
again getting his $193,000 salary plus a $90,395 an- some significant transformative kinds of changes in
01.04 151xx Lake Dr NE – Car/Garage Fire; deputies nual pension.
terms of how we do school, the board just felt very
responded to a car fire that spread to a detached
garage. Forest Lake Fire Department distinguished “It’s not just superintendents. It happens with prin- strongly they wanted to continue his (Dressen’s) leadthe fire. No one was injured in the fire.
cipals and other leadership,” said Susan Brott, Edina ership,” said Susan Brott of Edina schools.
Public Schools communications director. “I think Schools make the case that taxpayers actually save
EAST BETHEL
when we know we’re going to have a big wave of money since districts no longer pay into the “retired”
Arrests/Incidents
retirements, it’s a way to keep good people.”
employee’s state pension fund at the rate of 7.5 per01.03 Jackson St NE/197 Ave NE – PI Accident, 2nd
cent a year. But others view it as little more than an
Degree DWI; deputies responded to a two vehicle Since the Edina educator’s contract is quadruple the
personal injury accident. One of the driver’s appeared state $46,000 earnings limit for beneficiaries, Dressen accounting gimmick.
intoxicated. The male was transported to Mercy must defer part of his pension payment into an Earn- “Districts often claim these arrangements save monHospital and evaluated. The male was arrested after ings Limitation Savings Account for when he retires
ey, but what they really do is shift costs to the state’s
being cleared by staff.
— again.
underfunded pension system while essentially allow01.09 217xx Zumbrota St NW – 2nd Degree Assault;
deputies responded to a father/step-son assault. The “They receive the balance of their ELSA account at ing double-dipping by some retired superintendents,
son was arrested.
a later date, when they reach their normal retirement principals and teachers,” said Blake of the Freedom
age,” said John Wicklund, assistant executive director Foundation of Minnesota.
HAM LAKE
of administration for the Minnesota Teachers Retire- By rehiring superintendent Karen Orcutt for $188,000,
Thefts & Damage to Property
ment Association. “No interest is earned while funds Orono schools figure to save $37,000 in pension pay01.03 159xx Madison St NE – unsecure vehicle; cash accumulate in an ELSA account.”
ments over three years. The veteran administrator
01.05 25xx 139 Ln NE – damage to mailbox
also qualifies for a $103,800 pension.
Critics
consider
the
practice
“double-dipping”
by
01.05 138xx Terrace Rd NE – mail stolen from mailbox
public employees who draw a taxpayer-funded salary “Had we chosen not to do this, the concern was that
Arrests
at the same time as a pension. For unretired Redwood
01.04 University Ave NE/159 Ave NE – 3rd Degree Area Schools superintendent Rick Ellingworth, it there were approximately 20 districts looking for a
superintendent at that time; all would have been
DWI; deputies responded to a male passed out in
thrilled to offer a job to Dr. Orcutt. We did not want
his vehicle on the roadway. The male appeared means a $123,000 salary and $58,300 pension.
intoxicated. Field sobriety tests were conducted and “Even in the case of part-time consulting arrangements, to risk that and I am glad we did not,” Orono School
failed. The male was arrested. 21
it is a form of double-dipping. We should not allow dis- Board chair John Malone said in a statement.
tricts or individuals to game the system at the expense The latest TRA figures, calculated for a 2011 St. Paul
LINWOOD TOWNSHIP
of taxpayers,” said Jonathan Blake, who tracks public Pioneer Press report, show 5,700 pensioned educators
Arrests
pensions for the Freedom Foundation of Minnesota.
were back in the classroom, mostly substitute teachers
01.05 217xx Viking Blvd NE – Domestic Assault;
deputies responded to a ex-girlfriend/boyfriend “That happens a lot with CEOs of companies when earning less than $10,000. The state does not track the
domestic. The male was arrested.
they retire and go work somewhere else. I would not number of unretired superintendents and administrasay that it’s necessarily double dipping,” said Brott. tors, but TRA officials say it’s not enough to weaken
GOVERNMENT
“Double dipping would be, I’m working in one dis- the fund’s bottom line.
MEETINGS CALENDAR
trict, and I’m also making money in another district. “If you just look at it on the surface, I can understand
Mon. Jan. 19
That’s not what is happening.”
somebody wondering what is happening. But on the
HAM LAKE
City Hall offices closed
Ham Lake City Hall
Sue Ann Gruver retired as superintendent of Prior other hand, there are no additional dollars being ex15544 Central Ave NE Tues. Jan. 20
Lake-Savage Area Schools on Dec. 31, 2013. Two pended that would not have been expended for that
Ham Lake, MN 55304 City Council, 6 pm
days later, Gruver was rehired in the same job at a sal- person,” said Gary Amoroso, executive director of the
Wed. Jan. 22
Ph: 763-434-9555
Park
&
Tree
Comm.,
6
pm
ary of $160,000,
peaking at $167,000 in 2017,
along Minnesota Association of School Administrators.
www.ci.ham-lake.mn.us
x2, 2x4 & 2x8
ads to run ONE TIME, the week beginning
1/11/2015
Metro
Mon.
Jan.
26
with an annual $62,840 pension.
Hours: M-Th 7 AM - 4:30 PM
Fri: 7 AM-12 NOON

Planning Comm., 6 pm

OAK GROVE

Mon. Jan. 19
City Hall offices closed
Wed. Jan. 21
Parks Comm., 6:30 pm
Thurs. Jan. 22
Planning Comm., 7 pm
Mon. Jan. 26
City Council, 7 pm

Oak Grove City Hall
19900 Nightingale St. NW
Oak Grove, MN 55011
Ph: 763-404-7000
www.ci.oak-grove.mn.us

ANOKA CONSERVATION DISTRICT, 1318 McKay Dr
NE #300, Ham Lake (763) 434-2030 anokaswcd.org
Mon. Jan. 20 — Board of Supervisors, 5 pm
NORTH METRO CABLE COMMISSION (Ham Lake,
Blaine, Lexington, Circle Pines, Centerville, Lino Lakes,
Spring Lake Park) (763) 780-8241
Wed. Jan. 21 — Cable Comm., 6 pm, Spring Lake Park City Hall
Thurs. Feb. 5 — Executive Cmte., 6 pm, 12520 Polk St.,
Blaine, NMTV Studios
CITY OF RAMSEY, 7550 Sunwood Dr NW (763) 427-1410
Tues. Jan. 20 — Public Works Cmte, 6 pm
Tues. Jan. 27 — City Council “work session” 5:30 pm,
Reg Meeting 7 pm
Mon. Feb. 2 — Environmental Policy Board, 6:30 pm
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Call toll-free: 1-800-259-1096

Are You Still Paying Too Much For Your Medications?
You can save up to 93% when you fill your prescriptions
at our Canadian and International prescription service.
Their

Price

Bottle A
Manufactured By
PfizerTM.

Our

CelebrexTM
$761.35
Typical US brand price
for 200mg x 100

Price

Celecoxib
$64.00

Bottle B
Manufactured By
Generics
Manufacturers

Generic equivalent of CelebrexTM
Generic price for 200mg x 100

Get An Extra $10 Off & Free Shipping
On Your 1st Order!
Call the number below and save an additional $10 plus get free shipping on your first
prescription order with Canada Drug Center. Expires June 30, 2015. Offer is valid for
prescription orders only and can not be used in conjunction with any other offers. Valid
for new customers only. One time use per household.

Order Now! Call Toll-Free: 1-800-259-1096

Use code 10FREE to receive this special offer.

Please note that we do not carry controlled substances and a valid
prescription is required for all prescription medication orders.
Prescription price comparison above is valid as of November 1, 2014. All trade-mark (TM)
rights associated with the brand name products in this ad belong to their respective owners.

Call Toll-free: 1-800-259-1096

ANOKA COUNTY RECORD

A weekly free publication published by
Anoka County Record LLC
Subscriptions (check or money order)
sent 1st Class U.S. Mail $100/yr
Single issue $2 / by U.S. Mail

John Kysylyczyn, Owner and Publisher
E-mail:
editor@anokacountyrecord.com
Website:
www.AnokaCountyRecord.com

PO BOX 21014
COLUMBIA HEIGHTS, MN
55421-0014
(763) 220-0411
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Public Notice
The City of Ham Lake hereby gives public notice of its intent to aerate Ham
Lake to prevent winterkill of game fish. The City intends to use mobile
PAGE
6 may be used at any time. The aeration systems will ANOKA
COUNTY RECORD
systems
which
cause
areas of thin ice and open water
thatNOTICE
fluctuate greatly. If there are any NOTICE OF PUBLIC
OFFICE OF THE
PUBLIC
MINNESOTA
CITY OF
HAM LAKE
HEARING
questions concerning the aeration
system,
please contact Ham Lake City
SECRETARY OF STATE
CITY
OF
HAM
LAKE
The
City
of
Ham
Lake
hereby
gives
public
notice
of
its
intent
to
aerate
Ham
Lake
to
Hall at 763-434-9555.
CERTIFICATE OF
prevent winterkill of game fish. The City intends to use mobile systems which may be
used at any time. The aeration systems will cause areas of thin ice and open water
Dated:
15, 2015
andareJanuary
22, 2015
that ﬂJanuary
uctuate greatly.
If there
any questions
concerning the aeration system,
please contact Ham Lake City Hall at 763-434-9555.
Dated: January 15, 2015 and January 22, 2015 (Published Jan. 9 & 16, 2015 Anoka
Warning!
County Record)

Stay Clear ofWARNING!
Designated Areas!

STAY CLEAR OF DESIGNATED AREAS!

NOTICE OF INTENT TO
FRANCHISE
NORTH METRO
TELECOMMUNICATIONS
COMMISSION
The North Metro Telecommunications Commission
(the “Commission”), a Minnesota municipal joint powers commission consisting of the municipalities of
Blaine, Centerville, Circle
Pines, Ham Lake, Lexington, Lino Lakes and Spring
Lake Park, Minnesota (the
“Member Cities”), hereby
gives notice of intent to
consider an application for
a franchise from qualified
entities that are interested
in constructing a cable system and providing cable
service within the territorial
limits of the Member Cities.
Notarized applications that
contain all of the information required by Minn. Stat.
§ 238.081, Subd. 4 and that
comply with all state and
local requirements must
be received by 12:00 p.m.
on Thursday, February 12,
2015 at 12520 Polk Street
N.E., Blaine, MN 55434.
Each franchise application must be accompanied
by an application fee in
the amount of $10,000.00.
This fee shall be made
payable to the North Metro
Telecommunications Commission.
Every franchise proposal
submitted by an applicant
must include a design for
a state-of-the-art cable
system that is capable of
reliably providing a panoply of cable services to
subscribers of the Member
Cities. In reviewing each
applicant’s franchise application, the Commission
will consider all relevant
factors, including, but not
limited to: (i) comparisons
of the level, quality and
nature of cable services
proposed by the applicant
to that provided by the incumbent cable system operator; (ii) the cable-related
needs and interests of the
community, as identified
solely by the Member Cities and the Commission;
and (iii) information regarding industry trends, stateof-the-art
technologies,
modern cable services and
other related information.
The Commission will hold a
public hearing to consider
any franchise applications
it receives at 6:00 p.m. on
Wednesday, February 18,
2015, at 1301 81st Ave.
NE, Spring Lake Park, MN
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55432. All questions concerning the franchising process and any requests for
information should be directed to Ms. Heidi Arnson,
Executive Director, North
Metro Telecommunications
Commission, 12520 Polk
Street N.E., Blaine, MN
55434.
ISSUED BY THE NORTH
METRO TELECOMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION.
(Published Jan. 16 & 23, 2015
Anoka County Record)

OFFICE OF THE
MINNESOTA
SECRETARY OF STATE
CERTIFICATE OF
ASSUMED NAME
MINNESOTA STATUTES,
CHAPTER 333
The filing of an assumed
name does not provide a
user with exclusive rights
to that name. The filing
is required for consumer
protection in order to enable
consumers to be able to
identify the true owner of a
business.
1. List the exact assumed
name under which the
business is or will be
conducted:
Element Properties
2. Principal Place of
Business:
947 Lois Lane,
Lino Lakes, MN 55014
3. List the name and
complete street address
of all persons conducting
business under the above
Assumed Name, OR if an
entity, provide the legal
corporate, LLC, or Limited
Partnership
name
and
registered office address:
Rafe Redmond,
947 Lois Lane,
Lino Lakes, MN 55014
4. I, the undersigned,
certify that I am signing
this document as the
person whose signature is
required, or as agent of the
person(s) whose signature
would be required who has
authorized me to sign this
document on his/her behalf,
or in both capacities. I further
certify that I have completed
all required fields, and
that the information in
this document is true and
correct and in compliance
with the applicable chapter
of Minnesota Statutes. I
understand that by signing
this document I am subject
to the penalties of perjury
as set forth in Section
609.48 as if I had signed
this document under oath.
FILED: Jan. 11, 2015,
# 805171600021,
/s/ Rafe Redmond
(Published Jan. 16 & 23, 2015
Anoka County Record)

OFFICE OF THE
MINNESOTA
SECRETARY OF STATE
CERTIFICATE OF
ASSUMED NAME
MINNESOTA STATUTES,
CHAPTER 333
The filing of an assumed
name does not provide a
user with exclusive rights
to that name. The filing
is required for consumer
protection in order to
enable consumers to be
able to identify the true
owner of a business.
1. List the exact assumed
name under which the
business is or will be
conducted:
Owly and Company
2. Principal Place of
Business:
2228 Reiling Road
Lino Lakes, MN 55110
3. List the name and
complete street address
of all persons conducting
business under the above
Assumed Name, OR if an
entity, provide the legal
corporate, LLC, or Limited
Partnership name and
registered office address:
Pamela Larson Frink,
2228 Reiling Road
Lino Lakes, MN 55110
4. I, the undersigned,
certify that I am signing
this document as the
person whose signature is
required, or as agent of the
person(s) whose signature
would be required who
has authorized me to
sign this document on
his/her behalf, or in both
capacities. I further certify
that I have completed all
required fields, and that
the information in this
document is true and
correct and in compliance
with the applicable chapter
of Minnesota Statutes. I
understand that by signing
this document I am subject
to the penalties of perjury
as set forth in Section
609.48 as if I had signed
this document under oath.
FILED: Dec. 16, 2014,
# 798979900034,
/s/ Pamala Larson Frink
(Published Jan. 16 & 23, 2015
Anoka County Record)

NOW
PUBLISHING
WEEKLY!

COUNTY OF ANOKA
STATE OF MINNESOTA

TAKE NOTICE, that pursuant to the requirements of
Minnesota Law, a Public
Hearing shall be held before the Ham Lake Planning Commission on Monday, January 26, 2015 at
6:01 p.m. at the City Hall
located at 15544 Central
Avenue NE for the purpose
of considering the application of Glynn Haag for a
Conditional Use Permit to
operate Haag Companies,
Inc. (firewood processing)
at 16050 Naples Street NE
a parcel of land situated
in the City of Ham Lake,
Anoka County, Minnesota
and which is described as
follows to wit:
PIN 15-32-23-41-0001
UNPLATTED HAM LAKE
TWP NE 1/4 OF SE 1/4 /
RESERVING
A
STP
ALONG ELY LINE 2 RODS
WIDE FORA ROAD/ SECTION 15, TOWNSHIP
32, RANGE 23, ANOKA
COUNTY, MINNESOTA
At such hearing both written and oral comments will
be heard.
DATED: January 16, 2015
Dawnette M. Shimek
Zoning Official / Building
Clerk
City of Ham Lake
(Published Jan. 16, 2015
Anoka County Record)

OFFICE OF THE
MINNESOTA
SECRETARY OF STATE
CERTIFICATE OF
ASSUMED NAME
MINNESOTA STATUTES,
CHAPTER 333
The filing of an assumed
name does not provide a
user with exclusive rights
to that name. The filing
is required for consumer
protection in order to
enable consumers to be
able to identify the true
owner of a business.
1. List the exact assumed
name under which the
business is or will be
conducted:
It’s Only Food
2. Principal Place of
Business:
12214 Eagle Street NW,
Coon Rapids, MN 55448
3. List the name and
complete street address
of all persons conducting
business under the above
Assumed Name, OR if an
entity, provide the legal
corporate, LLC, or Limited
Partnership name and
registered office address:
John Politte
Janna Politte,
12214 Eagle Street NW,
Coon Rapids, MN 55448
4. I, the undersigned,
certify that I am signing
this document as the
person whose signature is
required, or as agent of the
person(s) whose signature
would be required who
has authorized me to
sign this document on
his/her behalf, or in both
capacities. I further certify
that I have completed all
required fields, and that
the information in this
document is true and
correct and in compliance
with the applicable chapter
of Minnesota Statutes. I
understand that by signing
this document I am subject
to the penalties of perjury
as set forth in Section
609.48 as if I had signed
this document under oath.
FILED: Nov. 7, 2014,
# 792268600029,
/s/ John Politte
(Published Jan. 16 & 23, 2015
Anoka County Record)

DEADLINE:
WEDNESDAYS – NOON
PUBLICATION DATE:
FRIDAYS

ASSUMED NAME
MINNESOTA STATUTES,
CHAPTER 333
The filing of an assumed
name does not provide a
user with exclusive rights
to that name. The filing
is required for consumer
protection in order to
enable consumers to be
able to identify the true
owner of a business.
1. List the exact assumed
name under which the
business is or will be
conducted:
Cottage Pottery
2. Principal Place of
Business:
19931 Sparre Road NW,
Nowthen, MN 55330
3. List the name and
complete street address
of all persons conducting
business under the above
Assumed Name, OR if an
entity, provide the legal
corporate, LLC, or Limited
Partnership name and
registered office address:
Chelsea Marie
Doriott Junge,
19931 Sparre Road NW,
Nowthen MN 55330
4. I, the undersigned,
certify that I am signing
this document as the
person whose signature is
required, or as agent of the
person(s) whose signature
would be required who
has authorized me to
sign this document on
his/her behalf, or in both
capacities. I further certify
that I have completed all
required fields, and that
the information in this
document is true and
correct and in compliance
with the applicable chapter
of Minnesota Statutes. I
understand that by signing
this document I am subject
to the penalties of perjury
as set forth in Section
609.48 as if I had signed
this document under oath.
FILED: Jan. 3, 2015,
# 803682500024,
/s/ Chelsea Doriott Junge

JANUARY 16, 2015
OFFICE OF THE
MINNESOTA
SECRETARY OF STATE
CERTIFICATE OF
ASSUMED NAME
MINNESOTA STATUTES,
CHAPTER 333
The filing of an assumed
name does not provide a
user with exclusive rights
to that name. The filing
is required for consumer
protection in order to
enable consumers to be
able to identify the true
owner of a business.
1. List the exact assumed
name under which the
business is or will be
conducted:
Crown Leatherworks
2. Principal Place of
Business:
5936 177th Ln NW,
Ramsey MN 55303
3. List the name and
complete street address
of all persons conducting
business under the above
Assumed Name, OR if an
entity, provide the legal
corporate, LLC, or Limited
Partnership name and
registered office address:
Julia Jordan-Rose
Murphy, 5936 177th Ln
NW, Ramsey MN 55303
4. I, the undersigned,
certify that I am signing
this document as the
person whose signature is
required, or as agent of the
person(s) whose signature
would be required who
has authorized me to
sign this document on
his/her behalf, or in both
capacities. I further certify
that I have completed all
required fields, and that
the information in this
document is true and
correct and in compliance
with the applicable chapter
of Minnesota Statutes. I
understand that by signing
this document I am subject
to the penalties of perjury
as set forth in Section
609.48 as if I had signed
this document under oath.
FILED: Nov. 16, 2014,
#794135400027,
/s/ Julia Murphy

OFFICE OF THE
MINNESOTA
SECRETARY OF STATE
CERTIFICATE OF
ASSUMED NAME
MINNESOTA STATUTES,
CHAPTER 333
The filing of an assumed
name does not provide a
user with exclusive rights
to that name. The filing
is required for consumer
protection in order to
enable consumers to be
able to identify the true
owner of a business.
1. List the exact assumed
name under which the
business is or will be
conducted:
Shawn’s Car Rescue
2. Principal Place of
Business:
326 Heritage Trail,
Circle Pines, MN 55014
3. List the name and
complete street address
of all persons conducting
business under the above
Assumed Name, OR if an
entity, provide the legal
corporate, LLC, or Limited
Partnership name and
registered office address:
Shawn Weems,
326 Heritage Trail,
Circle Pines, MN 55014
4. I, the undersigned,
certify that I am signing
this document as the
person whose signature is
required, or as agent of the
person(s) whose signature
would be required who
has authorized me to
sign this document on
his/her behalf, or in both
capacities. I further certify
that I have completed all
required fields, and that
the information in this
document is true and
correct and in compliance
with the applicable chapter
of Minnesota Statutes. I
understand that by signing
this document I am subject
to the penalties of perjury
as set forth in Section
609.48 as if I had signed
this document under oath.
FILED: Dec. 31, 2014,
#803086100038,
/s/ Shawn Weems,
Owner

2x2, 2x4 & 2x8 ads to run ONE TIME, the wee

(Published Jan. 9 & 16, 2015
Anoka County Record)

(Published Jan. 9 & 16, 2015
Anoka County Record)

(Published Jan. 9 & 16, 2015
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PUBLISH YOUR ASSUMED NAME LEGAL NOTICE HERE
$40 FLAT FEE FOR THE TWO REQUIRED PUBLICATIONS
LOWEST PRICE IN ANOKA COUNTY
e-mail: Editor@AnokaCountyRecord.com
See our website for more information about
how to submit your Assumed Name notice to us
Week of January 11, 2015
www.AnokaCountyRecord.com

STATEWIDE

Central

South

North

Metro

HELP WANTED - DRIVERS

AUTOS WANTED

MISCELLANEOUS

LINSMEIER TRUCKING
A MN based company is now hiring
Company Drivers & Owner/Operators
to pull hopper bottom in the upper Midwest. Home weekends. Call 320/382-6644

CASH TODAY
We’ll buy any car (any condition) + free
same day pick-up. Best cash offer guaranteed! Call for free quote: 855/977-9600

MISCELLANEOUS

DISH TV RETAILER
Dish TV Retailer -Save! Starting $19.99/
month (for 12 months.) Free Premium Movie Channels. Free Equipment, Installation & Activation. Call,
compare local deals!! 800/297-8706

NOW HIRING
Company OTR drivers. $2,000 sign on
bonus, flexible home time, extensive benefits. Call now! Hibb’s & Co. 763/389-0610

CANADA DRUG CENTER
is your choice for safe and affordable medications. Our licensed Canadian mail order
pharmacy will provide you with savings of
up to 75% on all your medication needs.
Call today 800/259-1096 for $10.00 off
your first prescription and free shipping.

SOCIAL SECURITY
DISABILITY BENEFITS
Unable to work? Denied benefits? We can
help! Win or pay nothing! Contact Bill
Gordon & Associates at 800/938-7051
to start your application today!

GOT KNEE PAIN?
Back Pain? Shoulder Pain? Get a
pain-relieving brace -little or no
cost to you. Medicare patients call
health hotline now! 800/755-6807

DONATE YOUR CAR
truck or boat to Heritage For The
Blind. Free 3 day vacation, tax deductible, free towing, all paperwork taken care of 800/439-1735

HELP WANTED
NORTH STAR COOPERATIVE
Cavalier ND is seeking a qualified General
Manager. This is a successful bulk & retail
energy, C Stores, and agronomy cooperative with sales of $35 million with multiple retail locations. Financial and personal management experience is required.
Email: larry.fuller@chsinc.com or fax
(888/653-5527) resume to: Larry Fuller,
5213 Shoal Drive, Bismarck ND 58503.

ANOKA COUNTY RECORD

ONLY $279 to reach a statewide audienceof 3 million readers!!! 1-800-279-2979
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